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IATI Implementation Schedule for ​​​ UK DFID
Overview: DFID’s IATI Implementation

Part 1: Public donor implementation plan 
1. When will data be published? Timetable and frequency of publication
2. Exclusions and constraints: Overview of exceptions, thresholds & constraints
3. How will data be published? How published data will be presented to users
4. What data will be published? Overview coverage. For each area of the standard:
a. Timetable for publication
b. Terminology used within donor systems
c. Exceptions, thresholds & constraints
Part 2: Implementation plan appendices for TAG secretariat only (Not attached)
5. Donor contacts 
6. How will data be published? Overview of systems and processes for implementing IATI 
7. What data will be published? Detailed coverage. For each data item:
a. An indication whether system changes are required
b. Timetable for publication
c. Terminology used within donor systems
d. Exceptions, thresholds & constraints
8. Implementation support needs
Overview: DFID’s IATI Implementation
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Part 1: Public donor Implementation schedule
1. When will data be published?
	Timetable and frequency of publication

	Which organisations/agencies will your IATI data cover?  (What % of your total development flows does this cover? What is missing?)
Initially IATI information for UK will cover DFID only (approx 90% of total UK ODA).  Discussion on the publication of  ODA information in IATI format from other government departments is ongoing.


	Overall timetable for publication (Provide a date for when these organisations will publish a) an initial set (incomplete) of IATI data b) full IATI implementation)
Full phase 1 implementation started in January 2011. DFID will start publishing project documents from January 2011.  Publication of results information (project completion reports, annual reviews) will commence in 2011 when available.  


	Timeliness and frequency of publication (How soon after data is captured and available internally will data be published? Will data be published on a monthly or quarterly basis?) 
DFID plans to publish project and transaction information monthly.  It is planned that information will be published by the 15th (UK) working day of each month and will include information that has been input up to the end of the previous month.


	How early in lifecycle will activity details be published? (Will activity details be published during the pipeline/identification stage or not until they are approved and in the implementation stage)
Project data will be published from the pipeline/identification stage (appraisal and design). Project documents will be published from approval stage.


	Data quality status (Do you want to identify the status of the quality/audit/statistical verification of data that is published in registry? Please indicate whether you anticipate doing this, and the likely timing of moving from unverified data to verified data)
The information that DFID provides to IATI will be operational data that has not yet necessarily been subjected to the rigours of statistical verification required before data is submitted to the CRS.
However, data is quality assured as part of the data capture process and DFID will not seek to differentiate between data published as unverified or verified.  For the initial period of implementation, DFID has instituted an additional “light touch” quality assurance process,.  Over the longer-term, the presumption is for quality assurance to take place in a devolved manner, in order to drive better compliance and quality of DFID’s work. 


	Resources available to implement IATI? (Please outline what staff and system resources are being made available to implement IATI, any relevant organisational structures e.g. working groups, and who is leading on IATI implementation)
DFID’s Aid Transparency Steering Group directs the implementation of the UK Aid Transparency Guarantee, which includes IATI commitments. DFID’s implementation of IATI is managed by existing systems and staff and is a cross departmental effort, primarily located in the Corporate Performance Group.  Policy direction is led by the Aid Effectiveness and Value for Money Department and technical implementation by the Information Systems Department.  Data is captured automatically through DFID’s project, procurement information management and electronic filing systems.  


	Other notes 



2. What are the exclusions from publication?
	Exceptions and constraints: general rules that exclude activities from being published. Any specific data item exclusions should be listed in section 4

	Thresholds (are there any thresholds on the value of activities or transactions to be published. Please specify what the general threshold limits are for publication)
When project data was first published by DFID in August 2009, projects that were closed before 13 August 2009 were excluded from publication and this exclusion will continue to be applied.  Projects that have been active since 13 August 2009 will be included in the IATI data. This will keep the projects published in the IATI XML consistent with the projects published on DFID’s web pages.

From January 2011, DFID will publish all active aid projects and components unless they fall in the following thresholds:

· Project was closed before 13 August 2009

· Project Stage is earlier than Appraisal and Design stage (ARIES Stage 3)

· Project budget is below £500



	Exclusions (Please identify any rules for excluding data or information that will either be applied automatically or used as a basis to manually exclude publication. Note that exceptions for publication should be kept to a minimum and based on existing national or other regulations)
For aid projects the assumption will be of automatic disclosure of any information that DFID has committed to publish, however a small number of exclusions apply to these in order not to do harm to DFID’s work or staff.  These are based on the key principles of the UK’s Freedom of Information Act and are as follows:
i. International relations: Information that may harm DFID’s relations with other governments or institutions.
ii. Security and safety: Information that may pose a risk to the security or safety of any individual, including DFID staff, contractors and beneficiaries.
iii. Personal information: Information that intrudes on the privacy of a person or could contravene confidentiality.
iv. Commercially sensitive information: Information that does harm to DFID’s or DFID’s partners or suppliers commercial interests.
v. Information that is exempt from disclosure under other policies or regulations



	Any general issues or other constraints
Some IATI data from the advanced stages of the standard is not currently captured in internal systems.  Work is ongoing on implementation.  All new data elements will be subject to a cost/ benefit analysis..



3. How will data be published? 
	Information for prospective users of information

	Licensing (Under which license will data be published: public domain or attribution? If the license does not meet the IATI standard please specify why. Please state whether you intend to use the IATI authorised license or another) 
DFID’s licensing policy meets the IATI standard.  When publishing our data on the web DFID is obliged to follow the guidance outlined by the UK National Archives.  DFID will allow use and reuse of the information free of charge in any format or medium, under the terms of the Open Government Licence.  This requires that information is attributed to the UK government. 
Where DFID has identified any third party copyright material, permission will need to be obtained from the copyright holders. 


	Definition of an activity and multi-level activities (How is an activity defined e.g. projects and programmes, or some other structure? Do you have multi-tiered project structures e.g. projects and sub-projects or components? AT which level do you intend to publish details?) 
DFID publishes at the project level.  For policy definition purposes, a project refers to all DFID-funded interventions, whether bilateral, core contributions to multilaterals, or agreements with non-governmental organisations etc .  

For technical definition purposes, projects are umbrella records that may encapsulate several components.   Some data elements, project purpose, documents, risk and scoring are stored at project level.  All other data is recorded at component level.

	Segmenting data for publication (The recommendation is to publish data segmented by country i.e. one data file for each country. Duplicate project data must not exist within different files, so projects targeting multiple countries or regional/worldwide by nature should be held within a non-country specific file(s). Is this a practical suggestion for your programme? How many projects are not specific to one country and what non-country files best suit your programme?)
DFID will segment data by recipient country (including where the ‘country’ is a region or a multilateral organisation).
For technical purposes, note that projects and components will be stored as activities in the country file. No “orphaned” (standalone) component activities will be allowed as project activities will be duplicated across country files when the project has components in more than one country file. As financial information is stored at component activity level and not at project activity level, there will be no duplication of financial data.


	Do you intend to provide a user interface in addition to raw IATI data? (Will IATI data be accessible for end users through an existing or a new user interface on your website? [Note: this is not an IATI requirement])
IATI data will be accessible through DFID’s Projects Database http://projects.dfid.gov.uk/.  
DFID will utilise a web-based Representational State Transfer (RESTful) service that creates the required IATI xml file on demand from the IATI registry.  



4. What data will be published – data coverage for IATI implementation
	Green
	Able to publish 

	Orange
	Able to publish but with either some caveats or some further work to do. Refer to publication notes. 

	Red
	Unable to publish. Refer to publication notes.


Coverage: publish as much data as possible for all new and ongoing projects. For each data item:
· Colour code according to the definitions above
· When data can start being published (with reference to the overall timetable for publication described above in section 2, indicate when in the publication timetable this data item will be published)
· Exclusions & thresholds (highlight any data specific thresholds or exclusions that you require for specific data items. Identify the reason the exclusion is sought:
a) Not applicable to organisation
b) A non-disclosure policy
c) Not currently captured and prohibitive cost
d) Other, specify)
· Terminology used within donor systems (IATI aims to produce a glossary that maps the terminology used within the IATI standard to terminology used within donor agencies and international institutions. Please describe the term for each data item used within your organisation/systems)
· Any issues or constraints relating to specific data items (add any notes relevant to public users about the publication of this data item and any reasons for orange or red coding)
Note: All items IATI Phase 1, unless indicated otherwise with  hatched shading 
a) Organisation
Note: definitions and code lists can be found at http://iatistandard.org/standard/organisation
	Information Area
[to be colour coded as above]
	Publication Date
	Exclusions (a, b, or c) and Thresholds
	Donor definition
	Publication notes

	Annual forward planning budget data for agency 
	Jan 2011
	Will provide data relating to current CSR period
	
	

	Annual forward planning budget data for funded institutions 
	
	
	
	We do not set budgets for individual institutions beyond our commitments to each institution.  Budget data for institutions can be derived from the budgets published for each project

	Annual forward planning budget data for countries
	Jan 2011
	Will provide data relating to current CSR period
	
	

	(UNDER CONSULTATION) Organisation documents
(Phase 1 those already published; Phase 2 others)
	From Jan 2011
	
	
	


b) Activities
Note: definitions and code lists can be found at http://iatistandard.org/standard/activities
	Information Area
[to be colour coded as above]
	Publication Date
	Exclusions (a, b, or c) and Thresholds
	Donor Definitions
	Publication notes

	Reporting Organisation
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Participating Organisation
(Funding)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Participating Organisation
(Extending)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Participating Organisation
(Implementing)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	We only record the details for the 1st level of implementation (i.e. who we directly give our money too).  There may be further organisations in the chain (e.g. a management agent further distributing funds to NGO’s, contractors etc), which we currently do not record

	Participating Organisation
(Accountable)
	
	
	
	We do not record this info in ARIES at present, but will consider recording for future publication

	Recipient Country
	Jan 2011
	
	
	At present only one country OR region is recorded on ARIES

	Recipient Region
	Jan 2011
	
	
	At present only one country OR region is recorded on ARIES

	Collaboration Type 
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Default Flow Type
	Jan 2011
	
	
	We are reporting under the definition we currently hold, but may need to reassess.

	Default Aid Type
	Jan 2011
	
	
	We are reporting where we have a mapping and further work is underway.

	Default Finance Type
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	IATI activity identifier
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Other activity identifiers
	
	
	
	This will be our DFID project identifier.  

	Activity Title (Agency language)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Activity Title (Recipient language)
	
	
	
	We do not record this info in ARIES.  However, we will publish a Project Summary document in the major local languages of the country for all projects approved from Jan 2011 which will contain this information.

	Activity Description (Agency language)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	This field will be populated with the Project Purpose data from ARIES.  We will also publish a Project Summary document in the major local languages of the country for all projects approved from Jan 2011.  

	Activity Description (Recipient language)
	Apr 2011
	
	
	This field will not be populated as we do not record this info in ARIES.  However, we will publish a Project Summary document in the major written local language of the recipient country.  

	Sector (CRS)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Sector (donor specific)
	
	
	
	

	(UNDER CONSULTATION) Country Budget Alignment Classification
	
	
	
	We do not record this info at present and await further guidance from IATI for consideration

	Activity Dates (Start Date)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Activity Dates (End Date)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Default Tied Aid Status
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Policy / Thematic Markers
	Jan 2011
	
	
	We can provide CRS markers and will reassess.

	Activity Status
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Activity Contacts 
	Jan 2011
	
	
	We will publish DFID’s Public Enquiry Point details rather than individuals contact details

	Activity Web Site
	
	check
	
	Not applicable. Standard requires occurrence of 0-many.  That does not mean that IATI does not meet the standard.

	Related Activity
	
	check
	
	Optional - DFID is using this section of the standard for parent/ sibling relationships under project/ component; not using multi-funded option

	Financial transaction
(Commitment)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	Financial transaction

(Disbursement & Expenditure)
	Jan 2011
	
	Will publish all transactions >£500
	We will publish transactions from 12th May 2010. 

	Financial transaction

(Reimbursement)
	
	
	
	We are publishing reimbursement information but we are unable to distinguish between funding and reimbursement currently 

	Financial transaction
(Incoming Funds)
	
	
	
	Optional – we are investigating applicability internally.

	Financial transaction
(Loan repayment / interest repayment)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	(UNDER CONSULTATION) Activity Budget 
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	(UNDER CONSULTATION) Planned Disbursements
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	(UNDER CONSULTATION) Activity Documents

(Phase 1 those already published; Phase 2 others)
	Jan 2011
	
	
	

	(OPTIONAL) Sub-national Geographic Location
	
	
	
	We do not currently record this info in our systems – further consideration within DFID is required

	(OPTIONAL UNDER CONSULTATION)
 Results
	
	
	
	Await further details from IATI

	(OPTIONAL UNDER CONSULTATION) Conditions
	Jan 2011
	
	
	This info is published in a document


Transparency in the UK: IATI in context





Transparency is a top priority for the UK.  Transparency is critical in improving, and demonstrating, value for money to UK taxpayers at a time of increased pressure on public spending.  In June 2010, the UK announced the ambitious Aid Transparency Guarantee (ATG) . The ATG commits us to:





Publishing more information, in a comprehensive, accessible, comparable, accurate and timely manner, in a common international standard. 


Making information more accessible and promoting feedback. 


Leading the transparency agenda internationally, pushing for full transparency in CSOs and multilaterals that we fund; donors; and partner countries. 





Our commitment to publish aid in an internationally comparable, comprehensive, accessible and timely format will be met by publishing through the International Aid Transparency Initiative (IATI) standard.  This section gives an overview of the additional information the UK will proactively publish and how DFID is delivering transparency as an organisation.





What additional information will the UK proactively publish?





In line with the IATI standard, beginning in January 2011, we will publish the following information on a monthly basis:





Significant new details of project level and transactional data in line with the IATI standard.  


All core project documentation, including our new project design document (business case), annual reviews, completion reports, and evaluations. In addition we will publish country plans and formal agreements with partners. Project summaries will be published and translated into major local languages of the relevant countries.


Our data will be published in an open, accessible format, using IATI XML format, and under an open “attribution only” licence.


A small number of exclusions will apply to sensitive information, based on the key principles of the UK’s Freedom of Information Act.


Full details of our IATI compliance are given in section 4 below.





Delivering Transparency





Implementing transparency has required a fundamental cultural and structural shift in DFID’s processes.  To the greatest extent possible, DFID is implementing its commitments through use of existing systems and staff, in order to minimise burden at a time when administrative resources are under pressure.  Data is captured automatically through DFID’s financial and management information and electronic filing system.  DFID’s implementation of IATI is a cross departmental effort, primarily located in the Corporate Performance Group.  





The following sections give more detailed and technical information on IATI implementation.
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